
Linda Lyshol <lysholl@branchdistrictlibrary.org>

Fwd: Library Penal Fines - November
1 message

Antonia Dauster <DausterA@branchdistrictlibrary.org> Wed, Dec 19, 2018 at 8:37 AM
To: Linda Lyshol <lysholl@branchdistrictlibrary.org>, Pam Bassage <psb@coldwatercpa.com>

Antonia Dauster

Financial Manager

Branch District Library

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Kelli Talbot <ktalbot@countyofbranch.com>
Date: Wed, Dec 19, 2018 at 8:29 AM
Subject: Library Penal Fines - November
To: Antonia Dauster <daustera@branchdistrictlibrary.org>

Good Morning Antonia,

It looks as though there will be no Library Penal Fines paid out this month as the Expenditures for the month exceeded the Revenues.  (see below) You probably are already aware of this but I just
wanted to let you know that no check would be created this month.  Thanks Antonia.  Have a Merry Christmas!

Kelli Talbot

Chief Deputy

Branch County Treasurer

Ph#:  (517)279-6450
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